
'Wealth Of Potential'

Laurel Lane
West Drayton

Middlesex
UB7 7TY



• End Of Terraced House

• Five Bedrooms (Four With En-Suites)

• Planning Permission Granted For Double
Storey Rear & Single Storey Side Extension

• Gas Central Heating

• Fitted Kitchen

• Parking

• No Upper Chain

DESCRIPTIONDESCRIPTIONDESCRIPTIONDESCRIPTION
PLANNING PERMISSION GRANTED (plans
available on request) for a double storey rear
extension and a single storey side extension. A
five bedroom end of terraced house with a
wealth of potential to extend to create a
generous home for the larger family or to let the
property out to sharers as a house in multiple
occupation. To the ground floor there is an
entrance porch, hall, kitchen/diner and two
bedrooms both with an en-suite shower room.
Stairs from the hall lead to the first floor landing
which provides access to three bedrooms (two
with en-suite shower rooms) and a bathroom.

OUTSIDEOUTSIDEOUTSIDEOUTSIDE
Front: A dropped kerb provides vehicular
access to an area to park a vehicle. Concrete
pathway leading to the front door. Timber gate
to side access.
Rear: Paved terrace with concrete pathway
leading to the rear of the garden. Lawn.
Detached garage with up and over door.

LOCATIONLOCATIONLOCATIONLOCATION
A local school, shopping parade and bus routes
are just a short walk. The town centre of West
Drayton (with mainline railway station

benefiting from Crossrail) and Uxbridge,
London Heathrow Airport, the motorway
network and Stockley Business Park are all
within easy motoring distance.

Guide Price £415,000

HEATING & HOT WATER
A gas fired combination boiler serves the
radiator system and provides the domestic hot
water.

WINDOWS
Mainly double glazed sealed unit windows.

COUNCIL TAX BAND
We understand that the current council tax
band is D.

SERVICES
Mains gas, electricity, water and drainage.

TENURE
Freehold.

VIEWINGS
Strictly by appointment with R Whitley & Co.
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